
PROJECT: JOHN DEUTSCH DRIVE AND 7TH AVENUE CULVERT IMPROVEMENTS Engineer's Estimate of Cost Martam Construction, Inc. Copenhaver Construction, Inc. Kovilic Construction Co., Inc. Bolder Contractors, Inc.

BID OPENING: AUGUST 16, 2018 Elgin, IL  60120 Gilberts, IL  60136 Franklin Park, IL  60131 Cary, IL  60013

BASE BID, PROJECT LOCATION #1, JOHN DEUTSCH DRIVE $474,712.00 As Read $665,029.00 As Read $785,892.00 As Read $1,113,071.00 As Read $1,152,301.00

CULVERT REPLACEMENT As Corrected n/a As Corrected n/a As Corrected $1,105,071.00 As Corrected n/a

BASE BID, PROJECT LOCATION #2, 7TH AVENUE $64,800.00 As Read $157,794.00 As Read $88,840.00 As Read $102,100.00 As Read No Bid

CULVERT REPAIRS As Corrected n/a As Corrected n/a As Corrected $63,100.00 As Corrected n/a

ALTERNATIVE BID FOR PROJECT LOCATION #1, JOHN DEUTSCH DRIVE $63,600.00 As Read $135,844.00 As Read $62,890.00 As Read $108,100.00 As Read No Bid

CULVERT REPAIRS As Corrected n/a As Corrected n/a As Corrected n/a As Corrected n/a

ALTERNATIVE BID FOR PROJECT LOCATION #2, 7TH AVENUE $709,200.00 As Read $748,048.40 As Read $639,856.00 As Read No Bid As Read No Bid

GEOPOLYMER LINING As Corrected n/a As Corrected n/a As Corrected n/a As Corrected n/a
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