
City of St. Charles
Concrete Installation and Replacement Bid
13-Jun-19

Item Quantity* Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price
Adjust Frame in Sidewalk 5 500.00$      2,500.00$           250.00$    1,250.00$           200.00$    1,000.00$           250.00$    1,250.00$           
Adjust Frame in Curb 5 650.00$      3,250.00$           250.00$    1,250.00$           500.00$    2,500.00$           250.00$    1,250.00$           
Portland Cement Sidewalk 5" 2000 12.00$        24,000.00$         15.00$      30,000.00$         19.00$      38,000.00$         25.00$      50,000.00$         
Portland Cement Sidewalk 6" 300 13.00$        3,900.00$           17.00$      5,100.00$           24.00$      7,200.00$           25.00$      7,500.00$           
Curb Removal & Replacement 600 45.00$        27,000.00$         76.00$      45,600.00$         70.00$      42,000.00$         67.00$      40,200.00$         

TOTAL BASE BID 60,650.00$         83,200.00$         90,700.00$         100,200.00$      

ALTERNATE  Items
Hot Mix Asphalt 3" Driveway Patch 30 72.50$        2,175.00$           150.00$    4,500.00$           500.00$    15,000.00$         No Bid
Portland Cement Drive 6" Replace 20 125.00$      2,500.00$           180.00$    3,600.00$           185.00$    3,700.00$           225.00$    4,500.00$           
Portland 6" High Early Replace 10 135.00$      1,350.00$           200.00$    2,000.00$           195.00$    1,950.00$           230.00$    2,300.00$           
Asphalt Class D 2" 10 65.00$        650.00$               120.00$    1,200.00$           400.00$    4,000.00$           No Bid
Asphalt Class D 4" 20 85.00$        1,700.00$           130.00$    2,600.00$           600.00$    12,000.00$         No Bid
Asphalt Class D 6" 40 110.00$      4,400.00$           140.00$    5,600.00$           700.00$    28,000.00$         No Bid
Asphalt Class D 8" 20 125.00$      2,500.00$           150.00$    3,000.00$           800.00$    16,000.00$         No Bid
Asphalt Class D 10" 20 155.00$      3,100.00$           160.00$    3,200.00$           900.00$    18,000.00$         No Bid
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