Bidder MP Systems Archon Hooper J.F. Electric Electric Conduit Henkels & McCoy

CUla-2-5" No Bid $116.60 No Bid No Bid $305.22 No Bid
CU1b - 2- 5" extra per foot No Bid $10.00 No Bid No Bid $3.25 No Bid
CU2a-4-6" No Bid $135.30 No Bid No Bid $354.75 No Bid
CU2b - 4 - 6" extra per foot No Bid $10.25 No Bid No Bid $6.50 No Bid
CU3a-6-6" No Bid $202.15 No Bid No Bid $372.83 No Bid
CU3b - 6 - 6" extra per foot No Bid $14.35 No Bid No Bid $9.75 No Bid
CU4a-9-6" No Bid $261.40 No Bid No Bid $387.23 No Bid
CU4b - 9 - 6" extra per foot No Bid $15.85 No Bid No Bid $9.75 No Bid
CU5a-12-6" No Bid $283.20 No Bid No Bid $405.72 No Bid
CU5b - 12 - 6" extra per foot No Bid $16.30 No Bid No Bid $9.75 No Bid
CUG - Straight MH Install No Bid $28,480.00 No Bid No Bid $26,711.15 No Bid
fcouostb - Straight MH extraper | giq $1,170.00 No Bid No Bid $1,125.00 No Bid
CU7 - TEE MH Install No Bid $30,900.00 No Bid No Bid $27,611.15 No Bid
CU7b - TEE MH extra per foot No Bid $1,465.00 No Bid No Bid $1,125.00 No Bid
CU8 - X MH Install No Bid $40,870.00 No Bid No Bid $27,611.15 No Bid

CU8b - X MH extra per foot No Bid $1,605.00 No Bid No Bid $1,125.00 No Bid



Bidder MP Systems Archon Hooper J.F. Electric Electric Conduit Henkels & McCoy
CU9 - Adjust Frame and Cover No Bid $4,630.00 No Bid No Bid $8,249.85 No Bid
CU10- 22.5 deg bend No Bid $250.00 No Bid No Bid $521.82 No Bid
CU11 - 45 deg bend No Bid $300.00 No Bid No Bid $521.82 No Bid
CU12 - 90 deg bend No Bid $350.00 No Bid No Bid $543.24 No Bid
CU13 - Core Drill 3" to 6" No Bid $450.00 No Bid No Bid $1,977.30 No Bid
. . 5% . . .
CU14 - Year 2 Extension No Bid . No Bid No Bid 2.5% from Year 1 No Bid
increase
. . 5% . . .
CU15 - Year 3 Extension No Bid . No Bid No Bid 2.5% from Year 2 No Bid
increase
Fiberl - LS PW to Sub 5 No Bid No Bid $67,691.23 No Bid $42,536.96 $72,975.00
Fiber2 - LS PW to Lift Station No Bid No Bid $23,493.67 No Bid $15,951.36 $25,550.00
Fiber3 - T&E Rate/hour No Bid No Bid $494.02 No Bid $339.20 $500.00
Fiber4 - T&E OT Rate/hour No Bid No Bid $628.70 No Bid $508.80 $680.00
Fiber5 - T&E 2X Rate/hour No Bid No Bid $763.36 No Bid $678.40 $858.00
Fiber6 - Mobilization No Bid No Bid $750.00 No Bid $2,713.60 $1,000.00
Fiber7 - Demobilization No Bid No Bid $750.00 No Bid $2,713.60 $1,000.00

Overhead - Straight Time- 8
hour workday/hour
Overhead - Straight Time- 10
hour workday/hour

$534.77 No Bid

$528.63 No Bid

$494.02 $501.71

$486.52 $501.71

$605.91 No Bid

$484.73 No Bid



Bidder MP Systems Archon Hooper J.F. Electric Electric Conduit Henkels & McCoy

Overhead Crew Rate with

$709.64 No Bid $644.40 $683.11 $864.66 No Bid
Flaggers/hour
Mobilization Charge $4,500.00 No Bid $1,500.00 $2,007.00 $6,670.00 No Bid
L T Overhead C -8
ong Term Overhead Crew $527.59 No Bid $494.02 $486.66 $593.80 No Bid
hour workday/hour
L T Overhead C -10
ong Term Overhead Crew $521.53 No Bid $486.52 $486.66 $475.05 No Bid
hour workday/hour
Overhead - 1.5X ti C
verhea ime Crew $656.86 No Bid $628.70 $712.93 $1,090.65 No Bid
Rate/hour
Overhead - 1.5X ti C
verhea ime Crew $882.55 No Bid $837.70 $993.85 $1,608.15 No Bid
Rate w/Flaggers /hour
Overhead - 2X ti C
verhea Ime Lrew $799.63 No Bid $763.36 $902.61 »848.28 No Bid
Rate/hour
Overhead - 2X ti C Rat
verhea ime Crew Rate $1,078.03 No Bid $1,032.16 $1,272.47 $1,106.05 No Bid
w/Flaggers /hour
A tice Deduction - Straight
'ppren ice Deduction - Straig $13.15 No Bid $11.00 $15.35 $15.00 No Bid
Time/hour
A tice Deduction - 1.5X
.ppren Ice Deduction $16.85 No Bid $15.00 $24.18 $21.00 No Bid
Time/hour
A tice Deduction - 2X
.ppren Ice Deduction $21.02 No Bid $19.00 $32.25 $27.00 No Bid
Time/hour
Deduct For No Private P t
educt For No Private Property $30.00 No Bid $35.00 $39.00 $28.00 No Bid
Cart/hour
i 2% above . ; ;
Year 2 Offer 2% above year 1  No Bid vear 1 3.5% increase 2.5% increase No Bid
2% ab

Year 3 Offer 4% above year 1  No Bid ye;fzove 3.5% increase 2.5% increase No Bid

VacEx1- half day rate $1,700.00 $1,950.00 No Bid No Bid $1,800.00 No Bid



VacEx2 - full day rate $2,100.00 $3,225.00 No Bid No Bid $3,600.00 No Bid
Bidder MP Systems Archon Hooper J.F. Electric Electric Conduit Henkels & McCoy
VacEx3 - additional hourly rate $200.00 $320.00 No Bid No Bid $450.00 No Bid
VacEx4 - Call out $200/hour $410/hr No Bid No Bid 750/hr No Bid
5% ) . . .
VacEx5 - Year 2 3% above year1 | No Bid No Bid 2.5% increase No Bid
increase
5%
VacEx6 - Year 3 6% above year 1 increase No Bid No Bid 2.5% increase No Bid

over Year 2





