Checkerboard Lot Site Improvements Bid

27-Jun-19
Evans & Son Geneva Construction Martam Construction Alamp Concrete Alliance Contractors
West Chicago, IL Aurora, IL Elgin, IL Schaumburg, IL Woodstock, IL
Base Bid Quantity Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total
Removal of Unsuitable Material 50 S 41.20 | $  2,060.00 | $ 75.00 | $ 3,750.00] $ 76.00 | $ 3,800.00 | $ 5.00 | $ 250.00 | $ 45.00 | $  2,250.00
Geotechnical Fabric 662 S 210 $ 1,390.20 | $ 1.75]|$ 1,15850] $ 400 | S 2,648.00]S 5.00|$ 3,310.00]$ 1.00 [ $ 662.00
Aggregate Subgrade Improvement 50 S 46.40 | $  2,320.00 | $ 55.00 | $ 2,750.00 ] $ 55.00 | $ 2,750.00 | $ 5.00 | $ 250.00 | $ 45.00 | $  2,250.00
Aggregate Base Course 168 S 2210 | $ 3,712.80] ¢ 52.00 | $ 8736.00] $ 56.00 | $ 9,408.00 | $ 10.00 [$ 1,680.00 | $ 45.00 | $  7,560.00
Preparation of Base 662 S 10.10 [ $ 6,686.20] $ 120 $ 794.40 ] $ 6.00 | $ 3,972.00]$ 5.00|$ 3,310.00 | $ 4.00 | $ 2,648.00
Bituminous Material - Prime Coat 1490 S 032|$ 476.80 | $ 1.00 | $ 1,490.00] $ 110 [$ 1,639.00]$ 0.01]$ 14.90 | $ 1.00 | $ 1,490.00
Bituminous Material - Tack Coat 298 S 0.50 | $ 149.00 | $ 2.00 | $ 596.00 | $ 110 | $ 327.80]$ 0.01|$ 298] S 1.00 [ $ 298.00
Hot Mix Asphalt - Binder 153 S 81.00 | $ 12,393.00] $ 108.00 | $ 16,524.00] S 144.00 | $ 22,032.00|$ 104.00 [ $ 15912.00|$ 119.25 [ $ 18,245.25
Hot Mix Asphalt - Surface 77 $ 112.00|$ 862400|S$ 14000 [ $ 10,780.00 | $ 156.00 [ $ 12,012.00 ] $ 145.00 | $ 11,165.00] $ 124.00 | $ 9,548.00
Portland Cement Concrete Sidewalk 1207 S 10.50 [ $ 12,673.50] $ 8.50 | $ 10,259.50 | $ 7.00 | $ 8,449.00 ]S 9.00 | $ 10,863.00 | $ 8.50 | $ 10,259.50
Detectable Warnings 10 S 4530 | $ 453.00 | $ 24.00 | $ 240.00 | $ 33.00 | $ 330.00 | $ 40.00 | $ 400.00 | $ 40.00 | $ 400.00
Pavement Removal 642 S 17.00 [ $ 10,914.00] $ 28.00 | $ 17,976.00] $ 18.00 [ $ 11,556.00 | $ 25.00 | $ 16,050.00 | $ 55.00 | $ 35,310.00
Curb Removal 59 S 19.60 [ $ 1,156.40] $ 20.00 | $ 1,180.00] $ 12.00 | $ 708.00 | $ 10.00 | $ 590.00 | $ 25.00 | $ 1,475.00
Combination Curb & Gutter Removal 88 S 5.60 | $ 492.80 ] $ 20.00 | $ 1,760.00 ] $ 12.00 [ $ 1,056.00]$ 10.00 | $ 880.00 | $ 25.00 [ $  2,200.00
Sidewalk Removal 1443 S 1.70 [ $ 2,453.10] $ 215 $ 3,10245] $ 2.00|$ 2,886.00] S 2.00|S$ 2,886.00] S 475 |S$  6,854.25
Storm Sewers, Class A 30 S 7760 | $ 2,328.00]$ 120.00|$ 3,60000]S 14400|$ 4,32000]$ 25000 (S 750000]$ 155.00 [ S 4,650.00
Manholes, Type A - Closed Lid 1 $ 1,516.00 [ $ 1,516.00] $ 8,000.00 | $ 8,000.00] $ 3,610.00 | $ 3,610.00]$ 5,000.00 | $ 5,000.00]$ 3,665.00 S 3,665.00
Manholes, Type A - Grate Lid 1 $ 2,250.00 [ $ 2,250.00] $ 7,700.00 | $ 7,700.00] $ 3,860.00 | $ 3,860.00 ] $ 5,000.00 | $ 5,000.00]$ 3,98500 S 3,985.00
Inlets, Type A 1 $ 1,011.00 [ $ 1,011.00] $ 4,000.00 | $ 4,000.00] $ 1,480.00 | $ 1,480.00]$ 2,500.00 | $ 2,500.00 | $ 2,425.00 | $ 2,425.00
Remove Manhole 2 $ 1,656.00 [ $ 3,31200]$ 700.00|$ 1,400.00] $ 450.00 | $ 900.00 | $ 500.00 | $ 1,000.00]$  250.00 | $ 500.00
Concrete Curb, Type B 43 S 39.88 | S 1,714.84] ¢ 40.00 | $ 1,720.00 | $ 31.00 | $ 1,333.00] $ 50.00 | $ 2,150.00 | $ 32.00 | $ 1,376.00
Combination Concrete Curb & Gutter 184 S 3115 | $ 573160] $ 28.50 | $ 5,244.00] $ 31.00 | $ 5,704.00 | $ 35.00 | $ 6,440.00 ] $ 36.00 | $ 6,624.00
Mobilization 1 S  652.00 | $ 652.00 | $ 4,800.40 | $ 4,800.40 | $12,500.00 | $ 12,500.00 | $ 29,000.00 | $ 29,000.00 | $ 20,000.00 | $ 20,000.00
Paint Pavement Marking - Lettering 5 S 95.80 | $ 479.00 | $ 10.00 | $ 50.00 | $ 26.00 | $ 130.00 | $ 10.00 | $ 50.00 | $ 23.00 | $ 115.00
Paint Pavement Marking - Striping 559 S 085 | $ 475.15 ] $ 1.25]$ 698.75 ] $ 2.00|$ 1,118.00] S 5.00|$ 2,795.00 ] $ 6.70 | S 3,745.30
Construction Layout 1 $ 2,495.00 [ $§ 2,495.00] $ 5,000.00 | $ 5,000.00]$ 6,480.00 | $ 6,480.00]$ 6,000.00 | $ 6,000.00]$ 5,300.00 S 5,300.00
Relocate Sign Panel 1 S 183.00 | $ 183.00 | $ 190.00 | $ 190.00 | $ 260.00 | $ 260.00 | $ 300.00 | $ 300.00 | $ 250.00 | $ 250.00
Concrete Planter Bed Removal 2 $ 711.00 | $ 1,422.00]$ 1,250.00|$ 2,500.00|$ 1,860.00 | $ 3,720.00 ] $ 1,500.00 | $ 3,000.00 ] $ 750.00 | $ 1,500.00
Total Base Bid $ 89,524.39 $ 126,000.00 $ 128,988.80 $ 138,298.88 $ 155,585.30

Alternate #1 - Concrete Lot
Deduct - Aggregate Base Course -37 S 20.00 | $ (740.00)] $ 52.00 | $ (1,924.00)] $ 55.00 | $ (2,035.00)] $ 40.00 | $ (1,480.00)] $ 45.00 | $ (1,665.00)
Deduct - Bituminous - Prime Coat -1490 S 032|$ (476.80)] $ 1.00 | $ (1,490.00)] $ 1.10 [ $ (1,639.00)] $ 0.01|$ (14.90)] $ 1.00 [ $ (1,490.00)
Deduct - Bituminous - Tack Coat -298 S 0.55 | $ (163.90)] $ 2.00 | $ (596.00)] $ 110 | $ (327.80)] $ 0.01|$ (2.98)] $ 1.00 [ $ (298.00)
Deduct - Asphalt Binder -153 S 81.00 | $ (12,393.00)] $ 108.00 | $ (16,524.00)] $ 144.00 | $ (22,032.00)] $  104.00 [ $ (15,912.00)] $ 119.25 [ $ (18,245.25)
Deduct - Asphalt Base -77 $  112.00 | $ (8,624.00)] $ 140.00 [ $ (10,780.00)] $ 156.00 [ $ (12,012.00)] $  145.00 | $ (11,165.00)] $  124.00 | $ (9,548.00)
Add - Portland Cement 8" 662 $  112.00 | $ 74,144.00| $ 94.05 | $ 62,261.10] $ 86.00 | $ 56,932.00 | $ 85.00 | $ 56,270.00] $  108.50 | $ 71,827.00
Add - Concrete Color Additive 157 $ 21500 $ 33,755.00 | $ 12320 [ $ 1934240 $ 112.00 [ $ 17,584.00] S 25.00 | $ 3,925.00] $ 60.00 | $  9,420.00
Add - Construction of Compass Design 1 $ 5,671.00 [ $ 5,671.00 ] $10,512.50 | $ 10,512.50 ] $11,650.00 | $ 11,650.00 | $ 15,000.00 | $ 15,000.00 | $ 14,650.00 | $ 14,650.00

Total Alternate #1 $ 91,172.30 $ 60,802.00 $ 48,120.20 $ 46,620.12 $ 64,650.75
Alternate #2 - Planter
Decorative Planters 4 $ 3,163.00 [ $ 12,652.00 No Bid $ 2,860.00 [ $ 11,440.00 ] $ 3,500.00 | $ 14,000.00 ] $ 1,775.00 | $ 7,100.00
Furnish and Place Topsoil 40 S 53.25 | $  2,130.00 No Bid S 78.00 | $ 3,120.00 | $ 60.00 | $ 2,400.00] $ 106.00 | S 4,240.00
Spray Irrigation System 1 $17,015.00 | $ 17,015.00 No Bid $17,520.00 | $ 17,520.00 | $ 18,000.00 | $ 18,000.00 | $ 48,100.00 | $ 48,100.00

Total Alternate #2 $ 31,797.00 No Bid $ 32,080.00 $ 34,400.00 $ 59,440.00
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