
AGENDA ITEM EXECUTIVE SUMMARY Agenda Item number:  5.p 

Title: Recommendation to Award the Bid for Hauling Services 

Presenter: AJ Reineking 

Meeting:  Government Services Committee                  Date:  March 27, 2017 

Proposed Cost:  $80,000.00 Budgeted Amount:  $80,000.00 Not Budgeted:     ☐ 

Executive Summary (if not budgeted please explain): 

On February 23, 2017, the Purchasing Division opened bids for the annual hauling services contract 

from the City’s facilities.  The City received four responses to this bid solicitation.   

The City utilizes hauling services to remove debris incurred throughout the maintenance and repair 

activities performed on public infrastructure, including water main breaks, roadway patching, electrical 

digs, tree removals, and storm sewer point repairs.   

S. Schoeder Trucking, Inc. submitted the lowest responsive bid for all categories of trucking services.

The City has utilized Schroeder for hauling in the past, and has found them to be very responsive and

timely.

Attachments (please list): 

* Bid Tabulation * Bid Specifications * Bid Price Sheets

Recommendation/Suggested Action (briefly explain):  

Recommendation to award the bid for Hauling Services to S. Schroeder Trucking, Inc. in the submitted 

bid rates, with an anticipated annual cost of $80,000.00. 



Hauling Services Bid

GSC: March 27, 2017

Straight Time Overtime Straight Time Overtime Straight Time Overtime Straight Time Overtime

Tractor/Lowboy Trailer 95.00$             95.00$             110.00$          125.00$          126.00$          150.00$      No Bid No Bid

Semi Tractor/20 Yd. Dump Trailer 89.00$             89.00$             91.00$             105.00$          111.00$          126.00$      No Bid No Bid

6 Wheel Dump/8 Yd. 80.00$             80.00$             88.00$             102.00$          120.00$          200.00$      116.00$         151.00$     

Langton Group

Woodstock, IL

S. Schroeder Trucking, Inc

Villa Park, IL

Nagel Trucking

Batavia, IL

C.H. Hager Excavating, Inc

West Chicago, IL
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