AGENDA ITEM EXECUTIVE SUMMARY | Agenda Item number: 5.q

Title: Recommendation to Award the Bid for Stone and Gravel
' Materials
. CHARLES Presenter: | AJ Reineking
Meeting: Government Services Committee Date: March 27, 2017
Proposed Cost: $54,765.00 Budgeted Amount: $75,000.00 Not Budgeted: [

Executive Summary (if not budgeted please explain):

On February 23, 2017, the Purchasing Division opened bids for the annual provision of stone and
gravel material for utilization throughout the community. The City received five responses to this bid
solicitation.

The Public Works Department utilizes stone and gravel materials to patch roadways, backfill after
emergency infrastructure repair, and to stabilize shorelines and basin walls.

Viking Brothers, Inc. submitted the lowest responsive bid for the base scope of the contract. Staff has
reviewed their bid for completeness, and feels that the alternate bid items that Viking did not submit
prices for can be acquired competitively from another provider.

Attachments (please list):

* Bid Tabulation * Bid Document * Bid Price Sheets

Recommendation/Suggested Action (briefly explain):

Recommendation to award the bid for the provision of stone and gravel materials to Viking Brothers,
Inc. in the submitted bid rate, with an anticipated annual cost of $54,765.00.




Stone & Gravel Bid Tabulation
GSC: March 27,2017

Viking Bros. Inc.

S. Schroeder Trucking, Inc.

C.H. Hager Excavating, Inc.

Nagel Trucking & Material

Vulcan Construction Materials

Aurora, IL Villa Park, IL West Chicago, IL Batavia, IL Naperville, IL
BASE BID Qty (tons) Unit Price | Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price | Unit Price [ Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price
CA-7, 3/4" Crushed Limestone 2000 S 16.75|S 33,500.00 | S 17.00 | S 34,000.00 | S 17.50 | S 35,000.00 | S 1899 (S 37,980.00 | $ 20.10 | $ 40,200.00
CA-6, Grade 8 Crushed Limestone 1000 {$ 12.00 (S 12,000.00 | $ 11.75 | $ 11,750.00 | $ 12.60 | $ 12,600.00 | $ 13.74 | S 13,740.00 | $ 15.35 | $ 15,350.00
Total Base Bid $ 45,500.00 | $ 45,750.00 | $ 47,600.00 | $ 51,720.00 | $ 55,550.00
ALTERNATE PRICING

CA-5, 1-1/2" Crushed Limestone 100 No Bid No Bid S 18.25 | S 1,825.00 | $ 17.00 | S 1,700.00|$ 17.98 | S 1,798.00 | $ 2295 | S 2,295.00

FA-2, Torpedo Sand 400 | 14.85]|S 5,940.00 | $ 16.75 | $ 6,700.00 | $ 17.50 | $ 7,000.00 | $ 15.35|$ 6,140.00 No Bid No Bid

CM-16, 3/8" Washed Stone 50 No Bid No Bid S 22.00|$ 1,100.00 | $ 2350 | $ 1,175.00|$ 1646 | S 823.00 No Bid No Bid
CA-16, 3/8" Washed Stone 50 No Bid No Bid S 22.00 | $ 1,100.00 | $ 25.50 | $ 1,275.00 | $ 1646 | S 823.00 | $ 35.00 | $ 1,750.00

CA-16 #4 Pea Gravel 50| |$ 16.00 (S 800.00 | $ 17.00 | $ 850.00 | $ 18.50 | $ 925.00 | $ 1598 (S 799.00 No Bid No Bid
FA-1 or FA-6 Trench Backfill Sand 100 |$ 9.25($ 925.00 | $ 13.00 | $ 1,300.00 | $ 12,15 | $ 1,21500|$  9.99 S 999.00 | $ 16.10 | $ 1,610.00
CA-1, 3" 100 |$ 16.00(S$ 1,600.00 | $ 15.95 | $ 1,595.00 | $ 17.50 | $ 1,750.00 | $ 1524 | $ 1,524.00 | $ 22,10 | $ 2,210.00
RR-3, Shot Rock "Rip Rap" 6"- 12" 100 No Bid No Bid S 36.00 | $ 3,600.00 | $ 39.75 | $ 3,975.00 | $ 32.00 | $ 3,200.00 | $ 40.00 | $ 4,000.00
RR-5, Shot Rock "Rip Rap" 8" - 12" 100 No Bid No Bid S 45.00 | $ 4,500.00 | $ 46.50 | $ 4,650.00 | $ 48.00 [ $ 4,800.00 | $ 50.00 | $ 5,000.00
Total Alternate Bid *[s 9,265.00 $ 22,570.00 $ 23,665.00 $ 20,906.00 *'s 16,865.00

*Did not respond to bid request in entirety




SECTIONS Hli-lV
PROPOSAL FORM (STONE/GRAVEL DELIVERED)

2017-2018
TYPE OF MATERIAL  QUANTITY PRICE (PER TON)
CA-7, 3/4" CRUSHED

LIMESTONE 2000 TONS s /7,50
CA-8, GRADE 8, | o
CRUSHED LIMESTONE 1000 TONS s [2-¢oO

The City will review this bid, and account for both charges averaging the best price presented. The
quantities are estimated and only provided to establish a unit price. The City reserves the right to award
this bid in the best interest of the City utilizing one vendor for both types of material (CA-7 and CA-6).

***Alternate Pricing not tied to this bid
CA-5, 1-1/2" §
CRUSHED LIMESTONE 100 TONS $ / 7

o
FA-2, TORPEDO SAND 400 TONS $ /7>

CM-16, 3/8” WASHED . 50
STONE 50 TONS s A3
CA-16, 3/8” WASHED o
STONE 50 TONS § AS*
CA-16 #4 PEA GRAVEL 50 TONS s /B
FA-1 OR FA-6 TRENCH o
BACKFILL SAND 100 TONS $ /2
CA1,3" 100ToNs  §_ /] >
SHOT ROCK (‘RIP-RAP?) -
6"-12" RR-3 100 TONS $ 29
SHOT ROCK (‘RIP-RAP”) | o
8"-12" RR-5 100 TONS $ 4>

ALL PRICES ARE FIRM THROUGH APRIL 30, 2018.

| propose to furnish the City of St. Charles stone and gravel material at above prices delivered
(including cartage) per ton, to various locations within the City limits, for the 2017/18 Construction
Season.



| certify that this Proposal has been arrived at independently and has been submitted without collusion

with any vendor of materials or supplies.

Bid information\Proposai\2017 STONE Gravel DelvrdProposal

COMPANY

(60 W) redlole 4Y. 4
DORESS

ITY, STATE, ZIP
> ., L d
ng — 5/ ~3A2
TELEPHONE

SIGNATURE OF AUTHORIZED AGENT




SECTIONS llI-lvV
PROPOSAL FORM (STONE/GRAVEL DELIVERED)

2017-2018
TYPE OF MATERIAL QUANTITY PRICE (PER TON)
CA-7, 3/4" CRUSHED
LIMESTONE 2000 TONS $ 18.99
CA-6, GRADE 8,
CRUSHED LIMESTONE 1000 TONS $ 13.74

The City will review this bid, and account for both charges averaging the best price presented. The
quantities are estimated and only provided to establish a unit price. The City reserves the right to award
this bid in the best interest of the City utilizing one vendor for both types of material (CA-7 and CA-6).

“**Altarnate Pricing not tied to this bid
CA-5, 1-1/2"
CRUSHED LIMESTONE 100 TONS $ 17.98

FA-2, TORPEDO SAND 400 TONS $ 15.35

CM-16, 3/8" WASHED

STONE 50 TONS $ 16.46
CA-16, 3/8” WASHED

STONE 50 TONS $ 16.46
CA-16 #4 PEA GRAVEL 50 TONS $ 15.98
FA-1 OR FA-6 TRENCH

BACKFILL SAND 100 TONS $ 9.99
CA-1,3 100 TONS $ 15.24

SHOT ROCK (“RIP-RAP?)
6"-12",RR-3 100 TONS $_32.00

SHOT ROCK (“RIP-RAP”)
8"-12",RR-56 100 TONS $ 48.00

ALL PRICES ARE FIRM THROUGH APRIL 30, 2018.

| propose to furnish the City of St. Charles stone and gravel material at above prices delivered
(including cartage) per ton, to various locations within the City limits, for the 2017/18 Construction

Season.



I certify that this Proposal has been arrived at independently and has been submitted without collusion

with any vendor of materials or supplies.

Bid Information\Proposal\2017 STONE Gravel DelvrdProposal

Nagel Trucking & Materials Inc.
COMPANY

1043 Paramount Parkway

ADDRESS

Batavia, IL. 60510
IV, STATE, ZiF

630-878-5595 Y/ </,
e

TELEP@E / ! 5; g ; g
GNATURE OF AUTHORIZED AGENT -




SECTIONS Illi-ivV
PROPOSAL FORM (STONE/GRAVEL DELIVERED)

2017-2018
TYPE OF MATERIAL QUANTITY PRICE (PER TON)
CA-7, 3/4" CRUSHED
LIMESTONE 2000 TONS
CA-6, GRADE 8,

CRUSHED LIMESTONE 1000 TONS

The City will review this bid, and account for both charges averaging the best price presented. The
quantities are estimated and only provided to establish a unit price. The City reserves the right to award
this bid in the best interest of the City utilizing one vendor for both types of material (CA-7 and CA-6).

*»**Alternate Pricing not tied to this bid
CA5 1-1/2" R
CRUSHED LIMESTONE 100 TONS s 1R.3S

FA-2, TORPEDO SAND 400 TONS s LW 1S
CM-16, 3/8” WASHED |

STONE 50 TONS $ 34.00
CA-16, 3/8" WASHED )

STONE 50 TONS g Ax.00
CA-16 #4 PEA GRAVEL 50 TONS $ \1.00
FA-1 OR FA-6 TRENCH

BACKFILL SAND 100 TONS $ 13,00
CA-1, 3" 100 TONS s 1S.9S
SHOT ROCK (“RIP-RAP”)

6"-12" RR-3 100 TONS g Jlo-0 0
SHOT ROCK (‘RIP-RAP”) -
8"-12" RR-5 100 TONS $ 45,00

ALL PRICES ARE FIRM THROUGH APRIL 30, 2018.

| propose to furnish the City of St. Charles stone and gravel material at above prices delivered
(including cartage) per ton, to various locations within the City limits, for the 2017/18 Construction
Season.



| certify that this Proposal has been arrived at independently and has been submitted without collusion

with any vendor of materials or supplies.

Bid Information\Proposal\2017 STONE Gravel DelvrdProposal

D SN0 ¢ Truckd o I
COMPANY

OO N Yile. Pve U\m@u

ADDRESS

Villes 0¥ ST (00\%3

CWYSWWEZP

L
TELEPHONE T /] .




SECTIONS IHi-lv
PROPOSAL FORM (STONE/GRAVEL DELIVERED)

20172018
TYPE OF MATERIAL QUANTITY PRICE (PER TON)
CA-7, 3/4" CRUSHED —
LIMESTONE 2000 TONS $ /A
CA-6, GRADE 8,
CRUSHED LIMESTONE 1000 TONS $ / 0? . /)D

The City will review this bid, and account for both charges averaging the best price presented. The
quantities are estimated and only provided to establish a unit price. The City reserves the right to award
this bid in the best interest of the City utilizing one vendor for both types of material (CA-7 and CA-6).

“*Alternate Pricing not tied to this bid 7
CA5, 1-1/2" 4
CRUSHED LIMESTONE 100 TONS $ Y

/
FA-2, TORPEDO SAND 400 TONS s /.85
CM-16, 3/8” WASHED /
STONE 50 TONS $
CA-16, 3/8” WASHED /
STONE 50 TONS $
CA-16 #4 PEA GRAVEL 50 TONS s /L.00
FA-1 OR FA-6 TRENCH o
BACKFILL SAND 100 TONS s 7.8
CA-1, 3" 100 TONS $ /é .00

SHOT ROCK (“RIP-RAP”)
6"-12”, RR-3 100 TONS $

SHOT ROCK (“RIP-RAP”)
8”-12", RR-5 100 TONS $

ALL PRICES ARE FIRM THROUGH APRIL 30, 2018.

| propose to furnish the City of St. Charles stone and gravel material at above prices delivered
(including cartage) per ton, to various locations within the City limits, for the 2017/18 Construction
Season.



I certify that this Proposal has been arrived at independently and has been submitted without collusion

with any vendor of materials or supplies. »
|l bhes T

" SENATURE OF AUTHORIZED AGENT
Bid Information\Proposali2017 STONE Gravel DelvrdProposal e ym et




SECTIONS lli-IV
PROPOSAL FORM (STONE/GRAVEL DELIVERED)

2017-2018
TYPE OF MATERIAL QUANTITY PRICE (PER TON)
CA-7, 3/4" CRUSHED 0
LIMESTONE 2000 TONS g 206,

CA-6, GRADE 8, 35
CRUSHED LIMESTONE 1000 TONS s /5.

The City will review this bid, and account for both charges averaging the best price presented. The
quantities are estimated and only provided to establish a unit price. The City reserves the right to award
this bid in the best interest of the City utilizing one vendor for both types of material (CA-7 and CA-6).

*»**Alternate Pricing not tied to this bid
CA-5, 1-1/2" Q5
CRUSHED LIMESTONE 100 TONS $ 22,

FA-2, TORPEDO SAND 400 TONS $ LoBid

CM-16, 3/8" WASHED

STONE 50 TONS s pBid
CA-16, 3/8” WASHED e
STONE 50 TONS $ 3.
CA-16 #4 PEA GRAVEL 50 TONS $ o Bid
FA-1 OR FA-6 TRENCH o
BACKFILL SAND 100 TONS $ /o,
CA-1, 3" 100 TONS § 22,77
SHOT ROCK (“RIP-RAP”) R
6"-12" RR-3 100 TONS $ &0, °
SHOT ROCK (‘RIP-RAP”) o
8"-12" RR-5 100 TONS $ 5O.

ALL PRICES ARE FIRM THROUGH APRIL 30, 2018.

| propose to furnish the City of St. Charles stone and gravel material at above prices delivered
(including cartage) per ton, to various locations within the City limits, for the 2017/18 Construction
Season.



| certify that this Proposal has been arrived at independently and has been submitted without collusion

with any vendor of materials or supplies.

Bid Information\Proposal\2017 STONE Gravel DelvrdProposal

Vileu lonstrection e lenels, L4 <

COMPANY

[Pec £ Ldsrenville . Sorle [ OO

ADDRESS

Wegerville , (£ ¢est 3
CITY, STATE, ZIP ‘
- 95 - 8BS e

TELEPHONE —

o e e e
4§T@NATURE OF AUTHORIZED AGENT
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