
AGENDA ITEM EXECUTIVE SUMMARY Agenda Item number:  5.r 

Title: Recommendation to Award the Bid for Asphalt Materials 

Presenter: AJ Reineking 

Meeting:  Government Services Committee                  Date:  March 27, 2017 

Proposed Cost:  $82,038.00 Budgeted Amount:  $90,000.00 Not Budgeted:     ☐ 

Executive Summary (if not budgeted please explain): 

On February 23, 2017, the Purchasing Division issued the annual Invitation to Bid to provide asphalt 

material for roadway and parking lot patching and repair programs.  The City received three responses 

to this bid solicitation.   

The Public Services Division utilizes asphalt materials for in-house maintenance to patch roadways 

throughout the year, and to restore roadways after underground infrastructure repairs.    

Plote Construction, Inc. of Hoffman Estates, IL submitted the lowest responsive bid.  The City has 

utilized material from Plote in the past and found the material to meet the City’s standards. 

Attachments (please list): 

* Bid Tabulation * Bid Document * Bid Price Sheets

Recommendation/Suggested Action (briefly explain):  

Recommendation to award the bid for the provision of asphalt materials to Plote Construction, Inc. in 

the submitted bid rate, with an anticipated annual cost of $82,038.00. 



Asphalt Materials Bid Tabulation

GSC: March 27, 2017

Type of Material Est. Qty. Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price

Surface Mix (ton) 1,000            51.00$          51,000.00$     56.00$      56,000.00$     58.50$         58,500.00$     

B.A.M Binder (ton) 500               50.00$          25,000.00$     54.00$      27,000.00$     54.50$         27,250.00$     

Cold Mix (per ton) 50                 120.00$        6,000.00$       No Bid No Bid 110.00$       5,500.00$       

U.P.M. (per ton) 50                 No Bid No Bid 125.00$    6,250.00$       129.50$       6,475.00$       

T.A.C (per 5-gallon bucket) 1                   38.00$          38.00$            60.00$      60.00$            75.00$         75.00$            

Dumping Fee per Ton - Asphalt No Charge 5.00$        No Charge

Dumping Fee per Ton - Concrete No Charge No Bid No Charge

Total 82,038.00$     89,310.00$     97,800.00$     

Plote Construction Inc.

Hoffman Estates, IL

Superior Asphalt Materials

North Aurora, IL

Builders Asphalt

Elburn, IL
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