
 

AGENDA ITEM EXECUTIVE SUMMARY Agenda Item number:  6.v 

Title: 
Recommendation to Award the Bid for Stone and Gravel Material to 

Viking Brothers, Inc.  

Presenter: Michael Shortall 

Meeting:  Government Services Committee                  Date:  April 23, 2018 

Proposed Cost:  $ 50,000 Budgeted Amount:  $  50,000 Not Budgeted:     ☐  

Executive Summary (if not budgeted please explain): 

 

On February 22, 2018, the Inventory Control Division opened bids for the annual provision of stone 

and gravel material for utilization throughout the Public Services Divisions. 

 

The City received four responses to this bid solicitation.  

 

The Public Services Department utilizes stone and gravel materials to patch roadways, backfill after 

emergency infrastructure repair, and to stabilize shorelines and basin walls.  

 

Viking Brothers, Inc. submitted the lowest responsive qualified bid for the base scope of the contract.   

 

 

 

 

 

 

Attachments (please list):  

 

* Bid Tabulation  

 

Recommendation/Suggested Action (briefly explain):  

 

Recommendation to Award the Bid for Stone/Gravel Material to Viking Brothers, Inc.  

 



2018/2019 STONE/GRAVEL DELIVERED BID TABULATION 
 

TYPE OF MATERIAL  QUANTITY SCHROEDER  SIVI  UTILITY TRANSPORT  VIKING    

CA-7, ¾” CRUSHED                   2000 TONS        $18.70/TON  $17.25/TON  $16.00/TON  $17.00/TON 
  
 
CA-6,GRADE 8, 
CRUSHED LIMESTONE             1000 TONS       $13.95/TON  $12.35/TON  $13.32/TON  $12.00/TON  
 

The City will review this bid, and account for both charges averaging the best price presented.  The quantities are estimated and only 
provided to establish a unit price.  The City reserves the right to award this bid in the best interest of the City utilizing one vendor for both 
types of material (CA-7 and CA-6).  
 

 
***Alternate Pricing not tied to this bid 

TYPE OF MATERIAL                     QUANTITY     SCHROEDER  SIVI  UTILITY TRANSPORT  VIKING    

CA-5, 1-1/2”                                100 TONS        NO BID   $26.00/TON                $22.42/TON  NO BID 
CRUSHED LIMESTONE                
   
FA-2, TORPEDO SAND                 400 TONS      $16.80/TON  $19.25/TON     $15.12/TON  $15.85 
   
CM-16, 3/8” WASHED                    50 TONS      $23.50/TON             $20.00/TON     $23.00/TON  NO BID 
STONE                                           
    
CA-16, 3/8” WASHED                     50 TONS     $25.50/TON  $23.50/TON     $23.00/TON  NO BID 
STONE                                               
 
CA-16 #4 PEA GRAVEL                 50 TONS      $16.50/TON  $18.25/TON                $15.62/TON  $16.75/TON  
 
FA-1 OR FA-6 TRENCH                100 TONS      $16.80/TON  $17.00/TON     $15.00/TON  $10.85/TON 
BACKFILL SAND                          
   
CA-1, 3”                                          100 TONS    $18.00/TON  $15.75/TON     $10.00/TON  $16.00/TON 
 
SHOT ROCK (“RIP-RAP”)               100 TONS     $42.00/TON  $34.00/TON     $35.00/TON  $37.00/TON 
6”-12”, RR-3                                  
   
SHOT ROCK (“RIP-RAP”)            100 TONS        $47.30/TON  $37.00/TON     $40.50/TON  NO BID               
8”-12”, RR- 5 

ALL PRICES ARE FIRM THROUGH APRIL 30, 2019 
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