
 

AGENDA 

CITY OF ST. CHARLES, IL 

GOVERNMENT SERVICES COMMITTEE MEETING 

RONALD SILKAITIS, CHAIRMAN 

 

MONDAY, JULY 22, 2019, 7:00 P.M 

CITY COUNCIL CHAMBERS 

2 E. MAIN STREET, ST. CHARLES, IL 60174 

 
 

1. CALL TO ORDER 

2. ROLL CALL 

3. ADMINISTRATIVE 

a. Electric Reliability Report – Information only.  

b. Natural Resources Commission Minutes – Information only.   

4.         OMNIBUS VOTE  

Items with an asterisk (*) are considered to be routine matters and will be enacted by one 

motion.  There will be no separate discussion on these items unless a council 

member/citizen so requests, in which event the item will be removed from the consent 

agenda and considered in normal sequence on the agenda. 

5. POLICE DEPARTMENT  

             a. Recommendation to approve Street and Parking Lot Closures and Amplification for 

the 2019 Scarecrow Festival.  

           *b. Recommendation to approve the Closure of Parking Lot “B” and IDOT Resolutions 

for the Closure of Main St. (Route 64) from 6
th
 Street to 2

nd
 Avenue for Two High 

School Homecoming Parades.  

             c. Recommendation to approve the Purchase of Three 2019 Ford Interceptor Taurus 

Sedans on the State Bid from Morrow Brothers Ford.  

6. PUBLIC WORKS DEPARTMENT  

 *a. Recommendation to Approve Construction Contract for Crack Filling. 

             *b. Recommendation to approve Construction Contract the Demolition of 1734 

Riverside Avenue.   
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            c. Recommendation to approve Professional Service Agreement for the Westside 

Wastewater Treatment Plant Expansion to Trotter and Associates, Inc. 

            d. Recommendation to award the Proposal for SCADA Program Management – Phase 

2 to Concentric Integration.   

            e. Recommendation to approve Budget Addition for “Checkerboard” Parking Lot Site 

Improvements.  

            f. Recommendation to award the Bid for City Hall “Checkerboard” Parking Lot Site 

Improvements.  

 

7. EXECUTIVE SESSION  

 

 Personnel –5 ILCS 120/2(c)(1) 

 Pending Litigation – 5 ILCS 120/2(c)(11) 

 Probable or Imminent Litigation – 5 ILCS 120/2(c)(11) 

 Property Acquisition – 5 ILCS 120/2(c)(5) 

 Collective Bargaining – 5 ILCS 120/2(c)(2) 

 Review of Executive Session Minutes – 5 ILCS 120/2(c)(21) 

8. ADDITIONAL ITEMS FROM MAYOR, COUNCIL, STAFF OR CITIZENS 

9. ADJOURNMENT 

ADA Compliance 

 Any individual with a disability requesting a reasonable accommodation in order to 

participate in a public meeting should contact the ADA Coordinator, Jennifer McMahon, at least 48 

hours in advance of the scheduled meeting.  The ADA Coordinator can be reached in person at 2 

East Main Street, St. Charles, IL, via telephone at 630 377 4446 or 800 526 0844 (TDD), or via e-

mail at jmcmahon@stcharlesil.gov.  Every effort will be made to allow for meeting participation.  

Notices of this meeting were posted consistent with the requirements of 5 ILCS 120/1 et seq. (Open 

Meetings Act).  

 

mailto:jmcmahon@stcharlesil.gov


 

AGENDA ITEM EXECUTIVE SUMMARY Agenda Item number:  3.a 

Title: Electric Reliability Report – Information Only 

Presenter: Tom Bruhl 

Meeting:  Government Services Committee                  Date:  July 22, 2019 

Proposed Cost:  $ Budgeted Amount:  $ Not Budgeted:     ☐  

Executive Summary (if not budgeted please explain): 
 

For Information Only. 
 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

Attachments (please list):  
 

June 2019 Outage Report  June 2019 Streetlight Repair Report 
 

Recommendation/Suggested Action (briefly explain): 
 

For information only. 

 



City of St. Charles

June 2019 Outages

OUTAGE No. DATE TIME OFF TIME ON (Min) AREA AFFECTED CIRCUIT No. CAUSE/RESPONSE NO. OF CUST.
OUTAGE 

MINUTES

MAJOR 

CATEGORY
SUB CATEGORY

1 6/1/2019 11:07 PM 0

Foxfield on the north, Kirk Rd. 

on the east, Production on 

the south, and Dunham on 

the west.

715
Mouse in switchgear - automatic 

reclose.
463 0 Animal Mouse

1 6/2/2019 11:45 AM 30
Foxfield, Hampton Inn, Bank, 

outpatient clinic.
715

Mouse in switchgear - switch out 

affected span to clean and test and 

put back in service.

3 90 Animal Mouse

2 6/12/2019 7:57 AM 0
Large sections of northeast 

and southeast quadrants.
L13154

ComEd had an instantaneous 

operation on 13154.  They had 

13156, 11167 abnormal and that 

load on 13154 causing loss of 

power to all 3.  Cause 

unknown/undetermined.  No action 

taken, ComEd patrolled line, no 

cause found.

2665 0 ComEd L13154

3 6/26/2019 7:05 PM 0

Rt. 31 corridor from RR 

tracks to northern city border.  

Includes Timbers, Wildrose 

Springs, North High School, 

Rivers Edge, and the 

Reserve.

224

Cause unknown - suspect lightning.  

City crews patrolled the line on 

6/27/19.

613 0 Unknown 12.47-kV

4 6/26/2019 7:07 PM 0

Large sections of the SW 

quadrant and part of Renaux 

Manor north of Rt. 64.

L56931

15 second momentary outage.  

Loss of ComEd 56931.  No action 

taken.  OA-RA.

2896 0 ComEd L56931

5 6/30/2019 1:48 AM 56

Downtown, Sub 3/Bay 1, Sub 

6/Bay 1, Costco, Randall, W. 

Main, Prairie, Rt. 38, Lowes, 

7th Ave., Rt. 25, Indiana 

Ave., PW Complex, State St., 

Cedar St., E. Main, Hunt 

Club, Q-Center

13150

ComEd 13150 lock-out.  Down wire 

in West Chicago.  Switched around 

13150, moved load to 7962 and 

56931. City Hall Sub customers 

restored first.

2627 147,112 ComEd 13150

5 6/30/2019 1:48 AM 67

Downtown, Sub 3/Bay 1, Sub 

6/Bay 1, Costco, Randall, W. 

Main, Prairie, Rt. 38, Lowes, 

7th Ave., Rt. 25, Indiana 

Ave., PW Complex, State St., 

Cedar St., E. Main, Hunt 

Club, Q-Center

13150

ComEd 13150 lock-out.  Down wire 

in West Chicago.  Switched around 

13150, moved load to 7962 and 

56931. Prairie Street Substation 

customers restored shortly after 

City Hall Sub.

407 27,269 ComEd 13150

6 6/30/2019 1:54 PM 40

CMD, Sub 5, Transformer 3, 

Cumberland, Patricia, 

Division, Ohio, Kautz, 37th 

Ave.

13156

No power.  Loss of ComEd 13156, 

lock-out.  Switched load to 13155-

11167.  ComEd line problem south 

of St. Charles in Geneva.

557 22,280 ComEd 13156

7 6/30/2019 2:17 PM 103 200-300 block of N. 7th St. 226
Storm blew down large tree limb.  

Removed tree and put wires back.
6 618 Weather Wind

Total of Interrupted Minutes 197,369

Total SAIDI* 12.591

Total of ComEd Interrupted Minutes 196,661

Total SAIDI without ComEd 0.045

*System Average Interruption Duration 

Index (SAIDI)

2019-MonthOutagesForms.xlsx

June 2019 Page 1 of 1



Fiscal Year
Number of Lights 

Repaired
Average Days to Repair

2019 873 5.7

Month Light Was 

Repaired

Number of Lights 

Repaired
Average Days to Repair

May 27 10.0

June 27 5.7

July

August

September

October

November

December

January

February

March

April

Streetlight Repair Report

Expectation:  Streetlights will be repaired within 10 days of notification.

2020



 

AGENDA ITEM EXECUTIVE SUMMARY Agenda Item number:  3.b 

Title: Natural Resources Commission Minutes – Information only  

Presenter: AJ Reineking 

Meeting:  Government Services Committee                  Date:  July 22, 2019 

Proposed Cost:  $ n/a Budgeted Amount:  $ Not Budgeted:     ☐  
Executive Summary (if not budgeted please explain): 
 
 
A duty of the Natural Resources Commission is to advise and consult with the Government Services 
Committee.  The June 13, 2019 Natural Resources Commission meeting minutes are attached.  
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Attachments (please list):  
 
* Natural Resources Commission Minutes – June 2019 meeting minutes. 
 
Recommendation/Suggested Action (briefly explain): 
 
For information only.  
 

 



MINUTES 
CITY OF ST. CHARLES  

NATURAL RESOURCES COMMISSION MEETING 
RALPH GRATHOFF, CHAIRMAN 

JUNE 13, 2019 
 

Members Present: Chairman Ralph Grathoff, Kathy Brens, Heather Goudreau, Lee Haggas,  
 Jillian Leturno, Suzi Myers, Loren Nagy, Pam Otto, Caroline Wilfong 
 
Members Absent: Isabella Bernat, Jon Duerr, Chloe Fanning, Tom Galante, Ryan Johnson,  

Claire Norman 
 
Others Present: Chris Adesso, Marcelline D’Argento, AJ Reineking 
 
Visitors Present: Kristen Sernett 
 
1. Call to Order & Pledge of Allegiance 

The meeting was convened by Chair. Grathoff at 7:01 p.m.  
 

2. Introduction of Visitors, Comments and Concerns  
Kristen Sernett re-introduced herself to all present [Ms. Sernett previously attended the February 
2019 Natural Resources Commission {NRC} meeting]. Ms. Sernett requested the NRC’s 
assistance in obtaining a “geese crossing” sign to be placed on Riverside Avenue by Langum 
Park. Mr. Adesso explained the State of Illinois Department of Transportation [IDOT] is 
responsible for the right-of-way at the above location, and the City of St. Charles is not 
authorized to install signage there. Mr. Adesso stated IDOT had informed him that signs such as 
“geese crossing” generally do not work to prevent accidents. IDOT declined the request to install 
a sign.  
 

3. Minutes Review and Approval   
Motion to approve and place into the public record the minutes of the May 9, 2019 NRC meeting. 
Motion by Comm. Otto, second by Comm. Goudreau to approve the minutes. Voice vote: 
unanimous; nays – none. Motion carried at 7:12 p.m.   

 
4. Old Business 

A. Arbor Day 
Chair. Grathoff briefly restated the NRC’s prior discussion regarding the change in venue for 
the City’s Arbor Day celebration [due to noise, limited parking, etc.].  Mount Saint Mary 
Park was previously suggested as a possible location. Motion to change the location of the 
annual St. Charles Arbor Day celebration from Lincoln Park to Mount Saint Mary Park as of 
April 2020. Motion by Comm. Brens to change the location of the Arbor Day event, second 
by Comm. Nagy. Voice vote: unanimous; nays – none. Motion carried at 7:17 p.m.   
 

B. Storm Drain Markers  
Comm. Goudreau reported she and several Commissioners completed installation of the first 
group of storm drain medallions on June 6, 2019; the installations went well. Comm. 
Goudreau also reported a resident in the Grandview Court area of the city contacted the NRC 
via Facebook regarding installing storm drain markers in their neighborhood. Comm. 
Goudreau will contact the resident and explain the process.  
 
The Commissioners agreed to meet again to install additional storm drain markers in target 
areas. The next group of markers will be installed on Thursday, July 18, 2019 at 6:00 p.m.  
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The Commissioners will meet at the parking lot near the Chamber of Commerce at 216 
Riverside Avenue. 
 
Comm. Otto suggested painting the embossed lettering on cast storm drains to highlight the 
“no dumping” wording.  

 
C. Greenest Region Compact Tool 

Mr. Adesso stated if the NRC is interested in supporting the mission and goals of the 
Greenest Region Compact, a resolution in support of the Compact should be submitted to the 
City Council.  

 
5. New Business 

Comm. Otto provided copies of a new edition of Under the Canopy, A Guide Selecting, 
Planting and Caring for Trees in Illinois. This publication was also offered to attendees at the 
2019 Arbor Day event.  
 

6. Committee Reports 
A. Education Committee 

Comm. Myers reviewed the next NRC article submissions for The Den newsletter: August, 
Comm. Johnson, Natives for Landscape; September, Comm. Nagy, Evergreens; and October, 
Comm. Haggas, Fall Clean-Up. Ms. D’Argento confirmed the July article regarding 
Pollinators was received from Student Comm. Bernat.  

 
B. Langum Woods Clean-Up Committee 

None. 
 

C. New Committee  
None. 
 

7. Public Services Division Tree Activity Reports April 2019 
Motion to approve and place into the public record the Public Services Division Tree Activity 
Reports for the month of May 2019. Motion by Comm. Myers, second by Comm. Brens. Voice 
vote: unanimous; nays – none. Motion carried at 7:45 p.m. 
 

8. Additional Items 
A. Commissioners 

Comm. Haggas informed the NRC he recently volunteered and planted native plantings in 
Delnor Woods.  
 
Comm. Myers described an agriculture tour she recently attended.  
 

B. City Staff  
Mr. Adesso informed the Commission the area at the base of the water tower at Red Gate 
Road was recently stabilized with native plantings to correct erosion.  
 

C. Visitors  
None. 
 

D. Adjournment  
Motion to adjourn the meeting. Motion by Comm. Brens, second by Comm. Myers. Voice 
vote: unanimous; nays – none. Motion carried at 8:00 p.m.  



 

AGENDA ITEM EXECUTIVE SUMMARY Agenda Item number:  5.a  

Title: 
Recommendation to Approve Street and Parking Lot 

Closures and Amplification for the 2019 Scarecrow Festival 

Presenter: Police Chief Keegan 

Meeting:  Government Services Committee                  Date:  July 22, 2019 

Proposed Cost:   
Police: $20,892.40 

Fire & EMA: $2,379.50 

PW: $11,698.84 

Total: $34,970.74 

Budgeted Amount:  $ Not Budgeted:     ☐  

Executive Summary (if not budgeted please explain): 

 

The 2019 Scarecrow Festival will be held on October 11-13, 2019.  With the merge of the St. Charles 

Convention Bureau with the Downtown Partnership, the St. Charles Business Alliance will now 

sponsor and oversee this festival in coordination with Ravenswood Event Services.   

 

Attached are the requested day/dates for parking lot and street closures. In addition, the Park District is 

requesting temporary “no parking by police order” signage to be installed from Thursday thru Sunday 

along the following routes: 

 Second Avenue between Park Avenue and North Avenue; 

 Second Avenue between North Avenue and Iroquois Avenue;  

 North Avenue between Second Avenue and Fifth Avenue. 

 

Event coordinators are also requesting permission to use directional signage on the public parkway and 

use of sound amplification during the event.  The Police Department requests authorization to modify 

the planned use area where it is operationally necessary. 

 

Attachments (please list):  

 

* Property Layout Maps for Scarecrow Festival * Street Closure Request 

 

Recommendation/Suggested Action (briefly explain):  

  

Recommendation to approve street and parking lot closures and amplification for the 2019 Scarecrow 

Festival. 

 

 





Updated: 6/20/19 

 

Street Closings, Parking Lot & Designated Handicapped Parking Requests 

St. Charles Scarecrow Fest 

October 11-13, 2019 (including set-up October 9 & 10, 2019) 

 
 

Parking Lot Closing Requests: 

East of Fox River 
1. Municipal Lot (City Lot J) adjacent to Municipal Building, – Saturday and Sunday – 

for handicapped & volunteer parking only. 

2. Municipal Lot (City Lot A) checkerboard lot at the corner of Main & Riverside – 

Saturday and Sunday – for handicapped parking only.  

 

Street Closing, Temporary One-Way, Handicapped Parking Requests: 

West of Fox River  
1. Closure: North Third St. between Main & State Streets from Thurs 5am to Sun 11pm   

East side will be maintained as a fire lane during festival hours Fri-Sat 9am to 9pm, 

Sun 9am-6pm. (police, fire & delivery vehicles to be allowed access each night 

between 9pm-9am from Main to Cedar).  

2. Closure: North Fourth St. between Main & Cedar Streets from Thurs 5am to Sun 

11pm. East side will be maintained as a fire lane during festival hours Fri-Sat 9am to 

9pm, Sun 9am-6pm. (police, fire & delivery vehicles to be allowed access each night 

between 9pm-9am from Main to Cedar).   

3. Closure: North Fifth St. between Main & Cedar Streets from Thurs 5am to Sun 

11pm.  West side will be maintained as a fire lane and access for residents only.    

4. Closure: Cedar St. between 2nd & 5
th
 St. Thu 5am- Sun 11pm. One side of the street 

will be maintained as a fire lane during festival hours Fri-Sat 9am to 9pm, Sun 9am-

6pm. (police, fire & delivery vehicles to be allowed access each night between 9pm-

9am from 2nd & 5
th
).   

5. Handicapped Parking: North Fifth St between Cedar and State Streets east side only 

handicapped parking: Fri at 6am to Sun at 6pm. (Signs need to be posted on 

Thursday.) 

6. Handicapped Parking: North Fourth Street between Cedar and State Streets west side 

only from Friday at 6am to Sunday at 6pm. (Signs need to be posted on Thursday). 

7. There will be No Parking Signs posted on North Fifth Street and North Fourth Street 

from Main St to Cedar St, North Third Street from Main St to State St and Cedar St 

between 2
nd

 and 5
th
 St.      

 

Parking Lot Closing Requests: 

West of Fox River 
1. River Plaza Parking/City Lot “G” (west side of N. Second Street [Route 31] between 

Cedar and State Streets on Wed 6am to Sunday 10pm for Windy City Carnival.  

2. Old VFW/City Lot “O” Wednesday at 6am to Monday at 12pm.  

3. Old St. Charles Court/City Lot “L” Wednesday at 6am to Sun at 11pm.  

 

Additional Requests: 
1. All parking spaces on the south side of Cedar Street between Fourth and Fifth Streets 

to place dumpsters, toilets, and limited-time entertainment parking (with festival 

permit only). Wednesday 6am to Sunday 10pm. 



Updated: 6/20/19 

 

2. Cedar Street at 3
rd

 street, north side.  Temporary NO parking in first three parking 

spots from corner to VFW lot entrance – for food storage trucks.   

3. Permission to use walkway/courtyard to the south and west of the Municipal Center 

for children’s activities and select vendors.  

4. Permission to place tents on Fourth Street between Main and Cedar Streets, west 

side.  

5. Permission to place tents on Fifth Street between Main and Cedar Streets, east side – 

flush against the park.  

 

Scarecrow Festival 2019: October 11-13 (open to public dates) 
Lincoln Park & VFW tent set up (south side of park & gazebo) Wednesday and Thursday, 

October 10 & 11: 8am-10pm. As always, due consideration will be a priority for students of St. 

Patrick.  

 

Event Days 
Friday and Saturday October 11 and 12: 10am-6pm; (Lincoln Park to remain open until 9pm) 

Sunday, October 7: 10am – 5pm.  

 

Shuttles (School buses)  

Will run Friday, Saturday and Sunday from the carnival to the craft show in 

Pottawatomie Park.  

   

PROPERTY BEING REQUESTED FOR VENDING/SPONSOR AREAS: 

 

 Lincoln Park 

 5
th

 Street from Cedar to Main 

 4
th

 Street from Cedar to Main 

 3
rd

 Street from Cedar to Main  

 Old VFW lot 

 Rt. 31 & Cedar Parking lot (for Carnival) 

 Old St. Charles Parking Lot (Filling Station) 

 Municipal lot  

 Municipal Courtyard - checkerboard lot (Sat only) 

 Commercial Riverwalk from Main Street to Pottawotamie Park 

 



AGENDA ITEM EXECUTIVE SUMMARY Agenda Item number: *5.b

Title: 

Recommendation to Approve Closure of Parking Lot “B” and 
IDOT Resolutions for the Closure of Main St. (Route 64) from 
6th Street to 2nd Avenue for Two High School Homecoming 
Parades 

Presenter: Police Chief Keegan 

Meeting:  Government Services Committee                  Date:  July 22, 2019 

Proposed 
Cost:  

STC East Parade 

PW: $2,834.72 

PD: $4,244.64 
(includes EMA estimate) 
TOTAL:$7,079.36 

STC North Parade 

PW: $2,876.26 

PD: $4,244.64 
(includes EMA estimate) 
TOTAL:$7,120.90 

Budgeted Amount:  $ 
Not Budgeted:     
☐ 

Executive Summary (if not budgeted please explain): 

The Special Event committee has met with members of both schools and reviewed the applications for 
the 2019 high school homecoming parades. East High School’s Homecoming parade will be held on 
Friday, September 6, 2019 and North High School’s Homecoming parade will be held on Friday, 
September 20, 2019. Both parades commence at 1:00 p.m., lasting approximately one half hour. 

Both schools have requested a partial closure of Municipal Lot “B”, the parking lot behind Flagship on 
the Fox, to better facilitate the parade logistics. No DJs are requested for either parade this year. 

Both high schools have requested the tradition continue by having the parades on Main Street from 6th

Street to 2nd Avenue.  Both parade routes will be traveling west to east.

Public Works will set up three garbage cans in the “set-up” parking lot across from the D303 

Administration building and three garbage cans in Municipal Lot “B”. They will also participate in the 
parade with one of their vehicles, along with the Police and Fire Departments. 

Attachments (please list): 

* Resolution

Recommendation/Suggested Action (briefly explain): 

Recommendation to approve Municipal Lot “B” partial closure and IDOT Resolutions for the closure 
of Main Street (Route 64) from 6th Street to 2nd Avenue for two High School Homecoming parades on
September 6 and September 20, 2019. 



City of St. Charles, Illinois 

Resolution No. _______________ 

 
A Resolution Requesting the Closure of Routes 64 and 31 for the  

St. Charles East and North High School Homecoming Parades 

 

Presented & Passed by the  

City Council on __________________ 
 

WHEREAS, the St. Charles North and East High Schools are sponsoring a Homecoming 

Parade in the City of St. Charles, and; 

 

WHEREAS, these Parades will require the temporary closure of Main Street (Route 64) 

and Second Street (Route 31)  state highways in the City of St. Charles, and; 

 

WHEREAS, Section 4-408 of the Illinois Highway Code authorizes the Department of 

Transportation to issue permits to local authorities to temporarily close portions of state 

highways for such public purposes or needs as parades and local celebrations; 

 

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the City Council of the City of St. Charles, 

Kane and DuPage Counties, Illinois, that permission to close Main Street (Route 64) and Second 

Street (Route 31) on Friday, September 6, 2019 from 12:45 p.m. to 2:30 p.m. for the St. Charles 

East High School Homecoming Parade and Friday, September 20, 2019 from 12:45 p.m. to 2:30 

p.m. for the St. Charles East High School Homecoming Parade be requested of the Department 

of Transportation; 

 

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that if such permission is granted by the Department of 

Transportation, all highway traffic during the periods of time specified shall be detoured over the 

following routes: 

 

 For westbound on Route 64: south on 5th Avenue (Route 25) to Illinois 

Avenue, west to 7th Street, north to Route 64.  For southbound on Route 31:  

west on State Street from Route 31 to 7th Street, south on 7th Street to Illinois 

Street, east on Illinois Street to Route 31.  For eastbound Route 64 and 

northbound Route 31, use the reverse route. 

 

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that if such permission is granted by the Department of 

Transportation, the City of St. Charles assumes full responsibility for the direction, protection 

and regulation of the traffic during the time the detour is in effect, and all liabilities for damages 

of any kind occasioned by the closing of the state highway, and it is further agreed that efficient 

all-weather detours will be maintained to the satisfaction of the Department and conspicuously 

marked for the benefit of traffic diverted from the state highway. 
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BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that a copy of this resolution be forwarded to the 

Department of Transportation to serve as a formal request for the permission sought in this 

resolution. 

PRESENTED to the City Council of the City of St. Charles, Illinois, this _______ day of 

____________ 2019. 

 

PASSED by the City Council of the City of St. Charles, Illinois, this _______ day of 

____________ 2019. 

 

APPROVED by the Mayor of the City of St. Charles, Illinois, this _______ day of 

___________ 2019. 

 

 

 

       ______________________________ 

       Raymond P. Rogina, Mayor 

 

ATTEST: 

 

____________________________ 

City Clerk 

 

COUNCIL VOTE: 

Ayes: 

Nays: 

Absent: 

Abstain: 

 

 
 



AGENDA ITEM EXECUTIVE SUMMARY Agenda Item number:  *5.c  

Title: 
Recommendation to Approve the purchase of three 2019 
Ford Interceptor Taurus Sedans on the State Bid from 
Morrow Brothers Ford 

Presenter: Erik Mahan – Deputy Police Chief 

Meeting:  Government Services Committee                  Date:  July 22, 2019 

Proposed Cost:  $85,695 Budgeted Amount:  $46,000 Not Budgeted:     ☒ 
Executive Summary (if not budgeted please explain): 

Staff is seeking approval to purchase three (3) – 2019 Ford Police Interceptor Sedans on the state bid 
from Morrow Brothers Ford, Inc. at a cost of $28,565.00 each. 

The purchase of one of these vehicles was budgeted.  That budgeted amount of $46,000.00 was for the 
scheduled replacement of vehicle #1900 a 2014 Dodge Charger patrol car.  This vehicle was approved 
by the City fleet management committee and also approved through the FY 19/20 budget. 

The purchase of the 2nd vehicle was not budgeted.  It is to replace vehicle #1994 a 2017 Ford 
Interceptor Utility which was damaged in a crash.  This vehicle will primarily be funded through an 
insurance payment of $13,476.00.  This vehicle was approved by the City fleet management committee 

The purchase of the 3rd vehicle is for the early replacement of vehicle #1773, a 2012 Ford Escape in 
need of replacement due to condition, age, and maintenance.  This vehicle was approved by the City 
fleet management committee. 

This pricing is per the State of Illinois CMS joint purchasing contract #4018503/4018504. 

Attachments (please list):  
Morrow Brothers Government Pricing Sheet. 
(3) Invoices From Morrow Brothers Ford, Inc.

Recommendation/Suggested Action (briefly explain): 
Recommend approval of a resolution authorizing the purchase of  three (3) 2019 Ford Police 
Interceptor Sedans from Morrow Brothers Ford, Inc. 











 

AGENDA ITEM EXECUTIVE SUMMARY Agenda Item number:  *6.a 

Title: 
Recommendation to Approve Construction Contract for 

Crack Filling 

Presenter: Ken Jay 

Meeting:  Government Services Committee                  Date:  July 22, 2019 

Proposed Cost:  $81,500 Budgeted Amount:  $81,500 Not Budgeted:     ☐  

Executive Summary (if not budgeted please explain): 

 

In 2017, the City began to expand the types of pavement strategies used to maintain our roadway 

network, with the understanding that it is important to choose the right treatment, for the right road and 

at the right time.  Pavement rejuvenation has been utilized as a preventative maintenance technique, 

and roadway base reclamation has been performed as a cost effective reconstruction alternative.   

 

In 2019, the City is adding crack filling as an additional preventative maintenance tool in an effort to 

keep the City’s streets in good condition for a longer period of time.  Crack filling addresses the most 

important principal of roadway maintenance:  drainage.  Crack filling ensures that drainage reaches the 

gutter and the storm sewer system, instead of penetrating the roadway surface and base course.  Water 

that reaches the roadway base course will be subject to freeze and thaw cycles during winter months, 

which leads to weaker roadway bases and essentially a shorter roadway lifespan.   

 

Staff’s intention for the crack filling program is to address roadways in good to fair condition, which 

should alleviate concerns regarding roadway pavement aesthetics.  All crack filling work is scheduled 

to be performed in September and October. 

 

On July 8, 2019, sealed bids for the 2019 Crack Filling contract were publicly opened and read aloud.  

The City received a total of two (2) bids for this project, with Denler, Inc. being the lowest responsive, 

responsible bidder.  Denler, Inc. has performed similar work for the Illinois Department of 

Transportation, Village of Lombard, Village of Buffalo Grove and the City of Naperville.  Reference 

checks provided extremely positive feedback; Staff recommends awarding a contract to the low bidder, 

Denler, Inc. of Joliet, Illinois, for a total amount not to exceed $81,500. 
 

Attachments (please list):  

 

* 2019 Crack Filling - Location Map 

 

Recommendation/Suggested Action (briefly explain): 

 

Recommendation to approve Construction Contract with Denler, Inc. for 2019 Crack Filling, in the 

amount of $81,500. 
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Notes:  Crack filling quantities are estimated and vary by street.  Locations subject to change.
             Work to be performed September 3 - October 15.



 

AGENDA ITEM EXECUTIVE SUMMARY Agenda Item number:  *6.b 

Title: 
Recommendation to Approve Construction Contract for the 

Demolition of 1734 Riverside Avenue 

Presenter: Ken Jay 

Meeting:  Government Services Committee                  Date:  July 22, 2019 

Proposed Cost:  $24,350 Budgeted Amount:  $40,000 Not Budgeted:     ☐  

Executive Summary (if not budgeted please explain): 

 

The City has been strategically procuring properties along 7
th

 Avenue Creek for the purposes of 

mitigating flooding issues and for future capital improvements.   

 

1734 Riverside Avenue was acquired in 2018 and resides in the floodway of 7
th

 Avenue Creek.  The 

construction contract includes demolition of the primary residence, as well as the garage, shed, fence 

and perimeter shrubbery.  Utilities will be disconnected and the property will be restored as a grass 

field.   

 

City staff will be subdividing the lot, which will allow the City to sell a buildable lot and recoup some 

of the acquisition and demolition fees.  The parcel that contains the floodway and floodplain will 

remain under City ownership. 
 

Bid Results:  
On July 8, 2019, sealed bids for the Demolition of 1734 Riverside Avenue contract were publicly opened and 

read aloud.  The City received a total of three (3) bids for this project, with the results shown below. 

 

Engineer’s Estimate                            $39,763.17 

Kendall Excavating                             $24,350.00 

Fox Excavating                                   $29,350.00 

Fowler Enterprises                              $31,650.00 

 

Kendall Excavating has performed similar work for the St. Charles Library, Village of Woodridge and the City 

of Aurora.  Staff recommends awarding a contract to the low bidder, Kendall Excavating of Yorkville, Illinois, 

for a total amount not to exceed $24,350. 

 

Attachments (please list):  

 

* Location Map 

 

Recommendation/Suggested Action (briefly explain): 

 

Recommendation to approve Construction Contract with Kendall Excavating for the Demolition of 

1734 Riverside Avenue in the amount of $24,350. 
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AGENDA ITEM EXECUTIVE SUMMARY Agenda Item number: 6.c 

Title: 

Recommendation to Approve Professional Service 

Agreement for the Westside Wastewater Treatment Plant 

Expansion to Trotter and Associates, Inc.  

Presenter: Tim Wilson 

Meeting:  Government Services Committee                  Date:  July 29, 2019 

Proposed Cost:  $2,563,800 Budgeted Amount:  $2,565,000 Not Budgeted:     ☐  

Executive Summary (if not budgeted please explain): 

 

The design portion of the Westside Wastewater Treatment project is budgeted for this fiscal year. The 

existing facility functions at 0.7 million gallons a day (MGD) and is reaching capacity to service 

existing customer and approved developments. This project will expand capacity of the facility to 1.05 

MGD, serving future developments on the west side of the city and easing demand on the existing 

facility. The expansion of the treatment facility will require an upgrade of the biological waste water 

treatment process to address recently promulgated and pending environmental regulations.  The 

regulatory demands that will be addressed within this section include: nutrient removal, phosphorus 

removal, suspended solids effluent requirements, bio-solids stabilization and several other regulated 

treatment capabilities. Construction bid advertisements are anticipated to go out the beginning of 

FY20/21 with the design of the facility expected to be completed around April of 2020. 

 

The funding source of this project is the Water Pollution Control Loan Program and requires a two-step 

process for Engineering Procurement based on the qualifications selection. The first step of this process 

is to issue a Request for Qualifications (RFQ). On March 29, 2019, the City received three (3) RFQ 

submissions. City staff evaluated the RFQ submittals and ranked the firms based on the standard 

criteria.  

 

The second step of the process is negotiating the contract and scope of work. The City started the 

negotiating phase on May 6,
 
2019. The proposed engineering contract for the project includes: design 

services, IEPA loan application, bid process, contractor negotiations and construction phase oversite 

and budgeting for this project extends over the next three years. Staff recommendations to approve and 

award the engineering contract in its entirety to Trotter and Associates, with final funding approved 

annually as part of the budget approval process.  

 

The engineering fees associated with this project are based on cumulative hourly rates not to exceed 

total project cost. Based on the complexity and size of the project, the proposal rates provided are 

comparable to several other Environmental Services projects. The City attorney has reviewed the 

contract and the recommended changes made.             

Attachments (please list):  

 

* Westside Wastewater Plant Expansion Professional Services Agreement  

 

Recommendation/Suggested Action (briefly explain): 

Recommendation to approve Professional Services Agreement for the Westside Wastewater Treatment 

Plant Expansion to Trotter and Associates for $2,563,800 and a Resolution authorizing the Mayor and 

Clerk to execute the same on the behalf of the City of St Charles.  

 











































 

AGENDA ITEM EXECUTIVE SUMMARY Agenda Item number: 6.d 

Title: Recommendation to Award the Proposal for SCADA 
Program Management – Phase 2 to Concentric Integration  

Presenter: Tim Wilson 

Meeting:  Government Services Committee                  Date:  July 22, 2019 

Proposed Cost:  $469,700 Budgeted Amount:  $500,000 Not Budgeted:     ☐  
Executive Summary (if not budgeted please explain): 
 
For reliability, efficiency and safety, the water and wastewater treatment and pump facilities require 
continuous automated operation. Currently, the backbone of this operation is controlled by the water 
and wastewater Supervisory Control and Data Acquisition (SCADA) systems. Both the water and 
wastewater utility’s SCADA system are comprised of computer hardware and software systems.  Due 
to the aging infrastructure, the SCADA system lacks security constraints, backup systems, has no 
integration to the City network and has limited data acquisition; therefore it is nearing the end of its 
life.  
  
In 2016 Concentric was selected as part of a request for qualifications process. Over the last two years 
Concentric successfully completed the first phase of the project. During this phase Concentric 
successfully worked with several departments within the City creating a SCADA network, updating the 
software packages and upgrading the lift stations.  In the next phase of this project, Concentric will 
provide program management services and subcontractor coordination. It will also involve 
technological improvements, the installation of the system at remote sites and the professional services 
to oversee and coordinate this phase of the project. Concentric will provide verification of installations, 
quality control testing of all equipment, and manage the work by subcontractors. In addition, they will 
configure and coordinate the SCADA network design and configuration with the City’s information 
system network and team.  
 
Concentric has great knowledge of the City’s current networks and the SCADA Master Plan. They 
have collaborated closely with Public Works and the Information Systems staff during the planning 
phase of this project, being the most qualified firm. Public Works recommends continuing this project 
with Concentric Integration to implement and oversee the next phase of improvements. 
 
 
Attachments (please list):  
 
*  Concentric Proposal Phase 2 
 
Recommendation/Suggested Action (briefly explain): 
 
Recommendation to award the Proposal for SCADA Program Management – Phase 2 to Concentric 
Integration for a not to exceed price of $469,700.  
 

 













 

AGENDA ITEM EXECUTIVE SUMMARY Agenda Item number:  6.e 

Title: 
Recommendation to Approve Budget Addition for 

“Checkerboard” Parking Lot Site Improvements 

Presenter: AJ Reineking 

Meeting:  Government Services Committee                  Date:  July 22, 2019 

Proposed Cost:   

$89,525 or $177,109 
Budgeted Amount:   Not Budgeted:     ☒  

Executive Summary (if not budgeted please explain): 

 

At the Government Services Committee’s direction, staff has received bids for the replacement of the 

“Checkerboard” Parking Lot, located in front of City Hall at the intersection of Main Street and 

Riverside Avenue, to include options for asphalt as well as decorative concrete.  The low price for the 

base bid received for this project, including site improvements with an asphalt surface, is $89,524.39.  

The option to include a decorative concrete surface brings the total price to $177,109.00.   

 

Either option will be offset by a $50,000 reimbursement grant that the City has received from the State 

of Illinois.  

 

 

 

 

 

 

Attachments (please list):  

 

None 

 

Recommendation/Suggested Action (briefly explain): 

 

Recommendation to approve a Budget Addition for the Checkerboard Parking Lot Site 

Improvements Base Bid (asphalt) in the amount of $89,524.39. 
 

OR  
 

Recommendation to approve the Budget Addition for the Checkerboard Parking Lot Site 

Improvements Alternate Bid (concrete) in the amount of $177,109.00. 

 
 

 



 

AGENDA ITEM EXECUTIVE SUMMARY Agenda Item number:  6.f  

Title: 
Recommendation to Award the Bid for City Hall 

“Checkerboard” Parking Lot Site Improvements  

Presenter: AJ Reineking 

Meeting:  Government Services Committee                  Date:  July 22, 2019 

Proposed Cost:  

$89,525 or $177,109 

Budgeted Amount:   

Requires Budget Addition 
Not Budgeted:     ☒  

Executive Summary (if not budgeted please explain): 

 

In February, the Government Services Committee was presented with three options for replacement of 

Parking Lot A, the “Checkerboard” parking lot located at City Hall.  The three options included 

reconstructing the lot out of asphalt, concrete, or pavers, with consideration given to site improvements 

that would remove one of the two steps up to the sidewalk, add one additional parking space, and 

enhance the drainage of the lot.  The Committee unanimously supported the site improvements, and all 

feedback indicated that the pavers would require too much maintenance.  There was general support for 

the concrete design over asphalt, but the members wanted to see an actual price difference based on real 

bids. 

 

With that direction, the Public Works Department finalized a design and solicited bids to include the 

site improvements and an asphalt base bid, with an optional alternate for decorative concrete surface, 

and a second optional alternate for a fixed irrigated planter system, similar to that in front of the 

building. 

 

The City received five responses to the solicitation.  Evans & Son of West Chicago submitted the 

lowest bid for the base bid, asphalt lot.  Martam Construction of Elgin, IL submitted the lowest bid if 

the City were to choose the decorative concrete alternative.  Both companies have worked for the City 

in the past and performed to the City’s expectations.  

 

The City is anticipating the award of a $50,000 grant from the State of Illinois in the coming weeks 

which is to be applied to this project. 

 

 

Attachments (please list):  

 

* Complete Bid Tabulation * Bid Tabulation: Totals Only for Evans & Son and Martam Construction  

* February 2019 Concept Design Images 

 

Recommendation/Suggested Action (briefly explain):   

 

Recommendation to award the base bid (asphalt) for Checkerboard Lot Site Improvements to Evans & 

Son in the amount of $89,524.39. 
 

OR  
 

Recommendation to award the base bid and Alternate 1 (concrete) for Checkerboard Lot Site 

Improvements to Martam Construction in the amount of $177,109.00. 

 

 



Checkerboard Lot Site Improvements Bid

27-Jun-19

Base Bid Quantity Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total

Removal of Unsuitable Material 50 41.20$           2,060.00$        75.00$           3,750.00$        76.00$           3,800.00$        5.00$             250.00$           45.00$           2,250.00$        

Geotechnical Fabric 662 2.10$             1,390.20$        1.75$             1,158.50$        4.00$             2,648.00$        5.00$             3,310.00$        1.00$             662.00$           

Aggregate Subgrade Improvement 50 46.40$           2,320.00$        55.00$           2,750.00$        55.00$           2,750.00$        5.00$             250.00$           45.00$           2,250.00$        

Aggregate Base Course 168 22.10$           3,712.80$        52.00$           8,736.00$        56.00$           9,408.00$        10.00$           1,680.00$        45.00$           7,560.00$        

Preparation of Base 662 10.10$           6,686.20$        1.20$             794.40$            6.00$             3,972.00$        5.00$             3,310.00$        4.00$             2,648.00$        

Bituminous Material - Prime Coat 1490 0.32$             476.80$            1.00$             1,490.00$        1.10$             1,639.00$        0.01$             14.90$              1.00$             1,490.00$        

Bituminous Material - Tack Coat 298 0.50$             149.00$            2.00$             596.00$            1.10$             327.80$           0.01$             2.98$                1.00$             298.00$           

Hot Mix Asphalt - Binder 153 81.00$           12,393.00$      108.00$         16,524.00$      144.00$         22,032.00$      104.00$         15,912.00$      119.25$         18,245.25$      

Hot Mix Asphalt - Surface 77 112.00$         8,624.00$        140.00$         10,780.00$      156.00$         12,012.00$      145.00$         11,165.00$      124.00$         9,548.00$        

Portland Cement Concrete Sidewalk 1207 10.50$           12,673.50$      8.50$             10,259.50$      7.00$             8,449.00$        9.00$             10,863.00$      8.50$             10,259.50$      

Detectable Warnings 10 45.30$           453.00$            24.00$           240.00$            33.00$           330.00$           40.00$           400.00$           40.00$           400.00$           

Pavement Removal 642 17.00$           10,914.00$      28.00$           17,976.00$      18.00$           11,556.00$      25.00$           16,050.00$      55.00$           35,310.00$      

Curb Removal 59 19.60$           1,156.40$        20.00$           1,180.00$        12.00$           708.00$           10.00$           590.00$           25.00$           1,475.00$        

Combination Curb & Gutter Removal 88 5.60$             492.80$            20.00$           1,760.00$        12.00$           1,056.00$        10.00$           880.00$           25.00$           2,200.00$        

Sidewalk Removal 1443 1.70$             2,453.10$        2.15$             3,102.45$        2.00$             2,886.00$        2.00$             2,886.00$        4.75$             6,854.25$        

Storm Sewers, Class A 30 77.60$           2,328.00$        120.00$         3,600.00$        144.00$         4,320.00$        250.00$         7,500.00$        155.00$         4,650.00$        

Manholes, Type A - Closed Lid 1 1,516.00$      1,516.00$        8,000.00$      8,000.00$        3,610.00$     3,610.00$        5,000.00$     5,000.00$        3,665.00$      3,665.00$        

Manholes, Type A - Grate Lid 1 2,250.00$      2,250.00$        7,700.00$      7,700.00$        3,860.00$     3,860.00$        5,000.00$     5,000.00$        3,985.00$      3,985.00$        

Inlets, Type A 1 1,011.00$      1,011.00$        4,000.00$      4,000.00$        1,480.00$     1,480.00$        2,500.00$     2,500.00$        2,425.00$      2,425.00$        

Remove Manhole 2 1,656.00$      3,312.00$        700.00$         1,400.00$        450.00$         900.00$           500.00$         1,000.00$        250.00$         500.00$           

Concrete Curb, Type B 43 39.88$           1,714.84$        40.00$           1,720.00$        31.00$           1,333.00$        50.00$           2,150.00$        32.00$           1,376.00$        

Combination Concrete Curb & Gutter 184 31.15$           5,731.60$        28.50$           5,244.00$        31.00$           5,704.00$        35.00$           6,440.00$        36.00$           6,624.00$        

Mobilization 1 652.00$         652.00$            4,800.40$      4,800.40$        12,500.00$   12,500.00$      29,000.00$   29,000.00$      20,000.00$   20,000.00$      

Paint Pavement Marking - Lettering 5 95.80$           479.00$            10.00$           50.00$              26.00$           130.00$           10.00$           50.00$              23.00$           115.00$           

Paint Pavement Marking - Striping 559 0.85$             475.15$            1.25$             698.75$            2.00$             1,118.00$        5.00$             2,795.00$        6.70$             3,745.30$        

Construction Layout 1 2,495.00$      2,495.00$        5,000.00$      5,000.00$        6,480.00$     6,480.00$        6,000.00$     6,000.00$        5,300.00$      5,300.00$        

Relocate Sign Panel 1 183.00$         183.00$            190.00$         190.00$            260.00$         260.00$           300.00$         300.00$           250.00$         250.00$           

Concrete Planter Bed Removal 2 711.00$         1,422.00$        1,250.00$      2,500.00$        1,860.00$     3,720.00$        1,500.00$     3,000.00$        750.00$         1,500.00$        

Total Base Bid 89,524.39$      126,000.00$    128,988.80$   138,298.88$   155,585.30$   

Alternate #1 - Concrete Lot

Deduct - Aggregate Base Course -37 20.00$           (740.00)$          52.00$           (1,924.00)$       55.00$           (2,035.00)$      40.00$           (1,480.00)$       45.00$           (1,665.00)$      

Deduct - Bituminous - Prime Coat -1490 0.32$             (476.80)$          1.00$             (1,490.00)$       1.10$             (1,639.00)$      0.01$             (14.90)$            1.00$             (1,490.00)$      

Deduct - Bituminous - Tack Coat -298 0.55$             (163.90)$          2.00$             (596.00)$          1.10$             (327.80)$          0.01$             (2.98)$              1.00$             (298.00)$          

Deduct - Asphalt Binder -153 81.00$           (12,393.00)$     108.00$         (16,524.00)$     144.00$         (22,032.00)$    104.00$         (15,912.00)$     119.25$         (18,245.25)$    

Deduct - Asphalt Base -77 112.00$         (8,624.00)$       140.00$         (10,780.00)$     156.00$         (12,012.00)$    145.00$         (11,165.00)$     124.00$         (9,548.00)$      

Add - Portland Cement 8" 662 112.00$         74,144.00$      94.05$           62,261.10$      86.00$           56,932.00$      85.00$           56,270.00$      108.50$         71,827.00$      

Evans & Son

West Chicago, IL

Geneva Construction

Aurora, IL

Alliance Contractors

Woodstock, IL

Martam Construction

Elgin, IL

Alamp Concrete 

Schaumburg, IL



Add - Concrete Color Additive 157 215.00$         33,755.00$      123.20$         19,342.40$      112.00$         17,584.00$      25.00$           3,925.00$        60.00$           9,420.00$        

Add - Construction of Compass Design 1 5,671.00$      5,671.00$        10,512.50$   10,512.50$      11,650.00$   11,650.00$      15,000.00$   15,000.00$      14,650.00$   14,650.00$      

Total Alternate #1 91,172.30$      60,802.00$      48,120.20$     46,620.12$      64,650.75$     

Alternate #2 - Planter

Decorative Planters 4 3,163.00$      12,652.00$      No Bid 2,860.00$     11,440.00$      3,500.00$     14,000.00$      1,775.00$      7,100.00$        

Furnish and Place Topsoil 40 53.25$           2,130.00$        No Bid 78.00$           3,120.00$        60.00$           2,400.00$        106.00$         4,240.00$        

Spray Irrigation System 1 17,015.00$   17,015.00$      No Bid 17,520.00$   17,520.00$      18,000.00$   18,000.00$      48,100.00$   48,100.00$      

Total Alternate #2 31,797.00$      No Bid 32,080.00$     34,400.00$      59,440.00$     

Total of Base + ALT 1 180,696.69$    186,802.00$    177,109.00$   184,919.00$    220,236.05$   

Total of Base + ALT 1 & 2 212,493.69$    No Bid 209,189.00$   219,319.00$    279,676.05$   



Checkerboard Lot Site Improvements Bid

27-Jun-19

Total Base Bid 89,524.39$    128,988.80$  

Total of Base + ALT 1 (Concrete) 180,696.69$  177,109.00$  

Total of Base + ALT 2 (Planters & Irrigation) 121,321.39$  161,068.80$  

Total of Base + ALT 1 & 2 212,493.69$  209,189.00$  

Evans & Son

West Chicago, IL

Martam Construction

Elgin, IL
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