



ST. CHARLES  
SINCE 1834

### AGENDA ITEM EXECUTIVE SUMMARY

Title: Award 2012/13 Hauling/Excavation Bids; Award Stone and Gravel Bids

Presenter: Chris Minick

*Please check appropriate box:*

<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	Government Operations (4/2/12)	<input type="checkbox"/>	Government Services
<input type="checkbox"/>	Planning & Development	<input type="checkbox"/>	City Council

Estimated Cost:	\$15,000; \$30,000 respectively	Budgeted:	YES	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	NO	<input type="checkbox"/>
-----------------	---------------------------------	-----------	-----	-------------------------------------	----	--------------------------

If NO, please explain how item will be funded:

**Executive Summary:**

C H Hager Excavating, Inc., submitted the low overall bids for the majority of categories. The Finance and Public Works Departments discussed the bids results. For any hauling/excavation jobs in 2012/13, we recommend C H Hager Excavating, Inc. Campton Construction submitted a low bid for the hauling rates for an Endloader, 14' Grader, Compactor, and Vibratory Roller. But Hager submitted a low bid for more equipment and materials. C H Hager Excavating, Inc. submitted a low bid for delivered and pit materials and equipment. Nagel Trucking & Materials, Inc. also submitted a low bid for delivering sand and shot rock. We anticipate having much more stone, gravel and sand delivered than we pick up ourselves but do pick up for jobs. Again, C H Hager Excavating, Inc. offers the lowest overall price.

**Attachments:** *(please list)*

Bid Tabulations (Hauling/Excavating; Stone/Gravel)

**Recommendation/Suggested Action** *(briefly explain):*

Recommendation to award Hauling/Excavation work to C H Hager Excavating, Inc. (West Chicago) and award Stone/Gravel work to C H Hager Excavating, Inc.

*For office use only:*

*Agenda Item Number: 6d*

Supplier	Campton Construction 825 Hicks Dr. Elburn, IL 60119	Nagel Trucking & Materials, Inc., 1043 Paramount Pkwy., Batavia, IL 60510	Stan White Trucking 37W230 Rt. 38 St. Charles, IL 60175	R. J. Justice 43W900 IL Rt. 64 Maple Park, IL 60151	Stokes Excavating P O Box 4403 Aurora, IL 60507	Heritage Logistics, LLC, 28361 Diehl Rd., Unit #B, #338, Warrenville, IL 60555	C H Hager Excavating, Inc., 180 Grandlake Blvd., W. Chicago, IL 60185	J & L Excavating/ Services, 48W692 Beith Rd., Maple Park, IL 60151
Semi Tractor/ Trailer	\$/92/hr. Straight time; \$117/hr. Overtime 150; 180	\$99/hr. Straight time; \$115/hr. Overtime 210; 240	No bid	No bid	No bid	\$92/hr. Straight time; \$92/hr. Overtime No bid	\$86/hr. Straight time; \$102/hr. Overtime 165; 188	No bid
Endloader	150; 180	210; 240				No bid	165; 188	
Crawler/Loader (3.25/yd)	160; 190	144; 175				No bid	135; 158	
1 1/4 yd. Track Excavator	160; 190	170; 200				No bid	150; 172	
Grader, 12 Ft. Blade	No bid	180; 210				No bid	175; 197	
Grader, 14 Ft. Blade	175; 205	180; 210				No bid	180; 202	
10 Yd. Dump Truck	No bid	99; 115				92; 92	76; 93	
Crawler/Loader (2.25/yd)	150; 180	127; 157				No bid	125; 148	
Crawler/ Dozer 9 Ft. Blade	175; 205	No bid				No bid	110; 132	
Compactor	150; 180	140; 170				No bid	155; 178	
Vibratory Roller	140; 170	140; 170				No bid	145; 168	
Bobcat, 55" Bucket	140; 170	115; 145				No bid	85; 104	
Tractor/Low-boy Trailer	115; 140	120; 135				No bid	100; 117	
Laborer	95; 120	75; 100				No bid	68; 95	
CA-6 Grd. 8	12.50/ton	11.00/ton				11.43/ton	\$9.25/ton	
CA-1 3"	14.00/ton	13.00/ton				14.43/ton	11.75/ton	

All prices are hourly rates.

DELIVERED PRICES

Supplier	CA7 3/4" Lime. (Chips) Semi--	--CA7 3/4" Lime. (Chips) 6Whlr	CA-6 Grade 8 Semi--	--CA-6 Grade 8 6 Whlr
Fox River Stone/LaFarge N.A.,1310 IL Rt. 31 S.Elgin, IL 60177	No bid	No bid	No bid	
Campton Construction 825 Hicks Dr. Elburn,IL 60119	No bid			
R. J. Justice, Inc. 43W900 IL Rt. 64 Maple Pk.,IL 60151	No bid			
Nagel Trucking & Materials, Inc., 1043 Paramount Pkwy. Batavia, IL 60510	\$14.10/semi/ton	\$17.10/ton	\$10.24/semi/ton	\$13.24/ton
Beverly Materials(Plote) 1100 Brandt Hoffman Estates,IL 60192	No bid			
Stokes Excavating P.O.Box 4403 Aurora,IL 60507	No bid			
<b>C H Hager Excavating, Inc., 180 Grandlake Blvd., West Chicago, IL 60185</b>	<b>13.00/semi/ton</b>	<b>14.60/ton</b>	<b>9.25/semi/ton</b>	<b>10.40/ton</b>
Heritage Logistics, LLC, 28361 Diehl Rd., Unit #B, #338, Warrenville, IL 60555	15.43/semi/ton	18.50/ton	11.43/semi/ton	14.85/ton

DELIVERED PRICES

SUPPLIER	FA-2 Sand Semi/6 Whlr	CA-16 Pea Gvl Semi/6 Whlr	FA-1/FA-6 Semi/6 Whlr	CA-1 3" Semi/6 Whlr	Shot Rock Semi/6 Whlr	Hauling,Rate/ Hr.,Semi/6 Whlr
Fox River Stone/LaFarge Campton	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid
R. J. Justice	No bid					
Nagel Trucking	\$11.45 (semi/ton)/\$14.45 (price/ton)	\$12.25 (semi/ton)/\$15.25 (price/ton)	\$9.70 (semi/ton)/\$12.70 (price/ton)	\$12.60 (semi/ton)/\$15.60 (price/ton)	\$28 (semi/ton)/\$31 (price/ton)	\$105/hr.; \$105/hr.
Beverly (Plote)	No bid					
Stokes Excavating	No bid					
C H Hager Excavating, Inc.	14.15 (semi/ton)/15.55 (price/ton)	11.75 (semi/ton)/13.25 (price/ton)	7.65 (semi/ton)/9.00 (price/ton)	11.75 (semi/ton)/12.90 (price/ton)	31.50 (semi/ton)/33.75 (price/ton)	86/hr.; 76/hr.
Heritage Logistics	11.88 (semi/ton)/14.95 (price/ton)	13.53 (semi/ton)/16.95 (price/ton)	10.63 (semi/ton)/13.95 (price/ton)	14.43 (semi/ton)/17.50 (price/ton)	32.68 (semi/ton)/37.15 (price/ton)	92/hr.; 92/hr.

RBW:cjb

F.O.B. PIT

SUPPLIER	CA-7 3/4" (Chips) Lime.	Agr. Lime	CA-6 Grade 8	CA-1, 3 >
Fox River Stone/LaFarge North America 1310 IL Rt. 31 S. Elgin, IL 60177				
Beverly Materials (Plote) 1100 Brandt Hoffman Estates, IL 60192				
Vulcan Con./Heritage Logistics, 1000 E. Warrenville Rd., Ste.#100, Naperville, IL 60563	\$11.50 (Bt)	No bid	\$7.50 00 (Bt)	\$11.00 00 (Bt)
<b>C H Hager Excavating, Inc., 180 Grandlake Blvd., West Chicago, IL 60185</b>	<b>3.20</b>	<b>3.20</b>	<b>3.20</b>	<b>3.20</b>

F.O.B. PIT

SUPPLIER	CA-5, 1.5" Septic Stone	FA-2 Sand	CA-16 Pea Gravel	FA-1/FA-6 Sand	Shot Rock
Fox River Stone/LaFarge					
Beverly Vulcan Con..E. Larson/Heritage	\$15.00 (Bt)	\$7.95 00 (Bt)	\$9.75 00 (Bt)	\$7.50 00 (Bt)	\$27.00 00 (Bt)
<b>C H Hager Excavating, Inc.</b>	<b>3.40</b>	<b>4.60</b>	<b>4.60</b>	<b>4.60</b>	<b>4.25</b>

KEY:

- Kv (Kaneville)
- Syc (Sycamore)

Heritage/Vulcan  
Bt (Bartlett)

RBW:cjb