ST. CHARLES

SINCE 1834

AGENDA ITEM EXECUTIVE SUMMARY

Title: Recommendation to Award Bid for Sanitary and Storm
Sewer Lining
Presenter: John Lamb

Please check appropriate box:

Government Operations

X | Government Services 09.24.12

Planning & Development

City Council

Public Hearing

Estimated Cost:

$630,700.00

Budgeted: | YES X NO

If NO, please explain how item will be funded:

Executive Summary:

City staff maintains the sanitary sewer system on an ongoing basis to decrease amount of inflow and
infiltration and repair points of service in the system. Sewer lining is a major part of this program and
is contracted out. Staff compiled bid specifications for the contract and bid opening. Budgeted amount
for sanitary sewer lining is $560,700.00. Also included is storm sewer lining that has a budgeted
amount of $70,000.00.

The sanitary sewer portion of the bid ($488,502.40) is within the budgeted amount. Storm sewer
portion ($89,716.00) is above the budgeted amount. However, staff can reduce amount of lining and
work with the contractor to come within budget with a change order for deduction.

A bid summary is attached.

Attachments: (please list)

Bid Summary

Recommendation / Suggested Action (briefly explain):

Recommend approval to Hoerr Construction in the amount of $578,218.40 and a Resolution
authorizing the Mayor and City Clerk to execute same.

For office use only:

Agenda Item Number: 6.]




City of St. Charles Sanitary and Storm Sewer Lining Project
Bid Summary

Hoerr Michels Pipe | American Pipe | Visu-Sewer Sheridan

Construction Service Liners, Inc. Plumbing
Sanitary Sewer | $488,502.40 | $667,282.00 | No bid $688.730.00 | No bid
Amount
Storm Sewer $89,716.00 | $137,718.00 | No bid $178,010.00 | No bid
Amount
Total $578,218.40 | $805,000.00 $866,740.00
Amount

Apparent Low Bidder for Sanitary Sewer:

Apparent Low Bidder for Storm Sewer:

Hoerr Construction at $488,502.40

Hoerr Construction at $89,716.00
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